
Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026  Annual Supply Contract of Seal Coating with Equipment and Application

1

Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank

4.84 0.00 4.84 1 3.85 1.15 5.00 3 3.60 1.28 4.88 2

4.84 0.00 4.84 1 3.85 1.15 5.00 3 3.60 1.28 4.88 2

4.84 0.00 4.84 1 3.85 1.15 5.00 3 3.60 1.28 4.88 2

4.84 0.00 4.84 1 3.85 1.15 5.00 3 3.60 1.28 4.88 2

Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank

5.59 0.00 5.59 1 4.75 1.15 5.90 3 4.40 1.40 5.80 2

5.59 0.00 5.59 1 4.75 1.15 5.90 3 4.40 1.40 5.80 2

5.59 0.00 5.59 1 4.75 1.15 5.90 3 4.40 1.40 5.80 2

5.59 0.00 5.59 1 4.75 1.15 5.90 3 4.40 1.40 5.80 2

Seal Coat AC-5 or AC-10

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 145,000

1

H&C Const

2

Matagorda Const

3

Sylva Const

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4

Prime Oil MC-30

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 7,000

1

H&C Const

2

Matagorda Const

3

Sylva Const

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4
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Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026  Annual Supply Contract of Seal Coating with Equipment and Application

2

Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank

2.75 2.75 2.70 2.70 0.00

2.75 0.00 2.75 2.70 2.70 0.00

2.75 0.00 2.75 2.70 2.70 0.00

2.75 0.00 2.75 2.70 2.70 0.00

Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank

No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00

No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00

No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00

No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00

*Ergon:

Allow 24 hours after order is placed for delivery

Pick up Location: 13811-A Old Highway 20, Manor, TX 78653

$.025 per gallon delivery fee 

 This bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 gallons.  Freight is based on a full transport load, even if a full load of material is not ordered. 

Pump and hose charge is $100.00 per load. Demurrage is billed at $100 per hour, after the second hour. Return freight is one-half of the 

common carrier's outgoingtariff rate. Federal Envionmental Fee will be added to bid prices at a rate of $0.00150/gal for emulsion loads or 

$0.49770/ton for asphalt & polyme loads. This fee is not inlcued in the bid price. For equipment ordered but no used (loads not cancelled in 

a timely manner), the carrier may charge up to a $400.00 cancelled load fee which will be paid by the customer. 

Prime Oil MC-30

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 7,000

1 2 3

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4

Seal Coat AC-5 or AC-10

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 145,000

4 Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions AC5* 4 Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions AC10*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4
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